TOWN OF GUILFORD

RFP #3-1718

BULKY WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES
JUNE 6, 2018

ADDENDUM #1

1. Inquiry: A potential bidder asked: “Can you send us the copy of the bid results the last time this was

sent out to bid?”

Response: Please see the attachment for a copy of the previous bid results.

2. Inquiry: A potential bidder asked: “Can you provide the amount of hauls per month for the past
year?”
Response:
APRIL | MAY | JUNE | JULY | AUG | SEPT | OCT | NOV | DEC |JAN |FEB | MARCH
2017 2017 | 2017 |[2017 (2017 |2017 [2017 |2017 |2017 | 2018 | 2018 | 2018
12 12 13 14 14 13 13 11 10 7 8 9

Response: The cost per ton paid is $66.63/ton.

Issued by:

Nicole Dankowski
dankowskin@ci.guilford.ct.us
Administrative Assistant
Purchasing Department

Town of Guilford

203-453-8015

. Inquiry: A potential bidder asked: “What is the current rate for hauling and per ton disposal cost?”




BID SUMMARY
TOWN OF GUILFORD
RFP #1-1213

BULKY WASTE MGMT SERVICES complete complete complete complete complete
Date: May 4, 2012
Time: 11:00 a.m. Bidder: 1 John's Refuse Bidder:2 CWPMLLC Bidder: 3 City Carting, Inc. Bidder: 4 Willimantic Waste All Waste

Northford, CT Plainville, CT Stamford, CT Willimantic, CT Hartford, CT
Opened By: Pam Millman
Witness: Kristen Elliott

Bid Surety: Y Bid Surety: Y Bid Surety: Y Bid Surety: Y Y

Check Bond Bond Check Check

Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount
Item Bid:
Total Base Bid (three year term) per ton: $80.00 $80.00 $85.00 $65.00 $72.00
Transportation per trip: $185.00 $230.00 $250.00 $200.00 $218.70
Alternate 1: Renewal (one three year period) no bid $85.00 $93.00 $66.63 no bid
Alternate 1: Transportation per trip no bid $260.00 $273.00 $205.00 no bid
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